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PRODUCT INFORMATION

Model 922160
Collection ViConnect
PROJECTS  PLUS
Width 253 mm
Height 145 mm
Depth 20 mm
Weight 0,659 kg
Description 300G

Glass
support frame and fastening 
bolts, water-saving dual flush 
plate
individual packaging materials
surface made of high-quality 
safety glass, metal buttons 
(brushed stainless steel look)
Suitable for combination with 
ViConnect toilet elements and 
cisterns, Installation kit for flush-
mounted installation optionally 
available, Distance frame for 
covering uneven tile edges 
optionally available
front operated

Material Glass
Specification texts ViConnect; Toilet flush plate; 

300G; Glass; Size: 253 x 145 x 
20 mm; Angular; support frame 
and fastening bolts, water-
saving dual flush plate; 
individual packaging materials; 
surface made of high-quality 
safety glass, metal buttons 
(brushed stainless steel look); 
Suitable for combination with 
ViConnect toilet elements and 
cisterns, Installation kit for flush-
mounted installation optionally 
available, Distance frame for 
covering uneven tile edges 
optionally available ; front 
operated
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COLOURS

PREVIEW COLOUR NAME COLOUR CODE ARTICLE NUMBER PRICE

Glass Glossy Grey 922160RA 4051202722210

Glass Glossy Black 922160RB 4051202722227

Glass Glossy White 922160RE 4051202722234


